
SERVICE ITEM QUANTITY UNIT COST EXTENDED COST UNIT COST EXTENDED COST UNIT COST EXTENDED COST

Group 1 Traditional 

Telephone Line Services

Centrex or Equal Full Feature 

Telephone Line with 

Unlimited Calling (No Toll 

within the US; Monthly) 1,000 $5.00 $33.99 $33,990.00 $30.00 $30,000.00

Subscriber Line Charge $6.16

Fed Universal Serv Fund $0.20
E911  Surcharge $0.57

Fed Access Charge $1.50
Access Recovery Charge $1.44

Total CTX Line Charge $14.87 $14,870.00

Centrex or Equal Full Feature 

Telephone Line Voice Mail 

(Monthly) 1,000 $2.95 $2,950.00 $5.00 $5,000.00 $2.50 $2,500.00

Full Service Business Line (No 

toll charges within the US; 

Monthly) 500 $12.99 $33.99 $16,995.00 $30.00 $15,000.00

Subscriber Line Charge $6.16

Fed Universal Serv Fund $1.77

E911  Surcharge $0.57

Fed Access Charge $1.50

Access Recovery Charge $1.44

Total CTX Line Charge $24.43 $12,215.00
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Full Service Business Line 

Voice Mail (Monthly) 500 $2.95 $1,475.00 $5.00 $2,500.00 $2.50 $1,250.00

Measured Service Business 

Line (Monthly) 500 $11.99 $19.99 $9,995.00 $20.00 $10,000.00

Subscriber Line Charge $6.16

Fed Universal Serv Fund $1.77

E911  Surcharge $0.57

Fed Access Charge $1.50

Access Recovery Charge $1.44

Total CTX Line Charge $23.43 $11,715.00

NH LATA toll Calling (Per 

Minute) 10,000 $0.018 $0.04 $400.00 $0.025 $250.00

$0.0028

$0.0208 $208.08

InterLATA Toll Calling (Per 

Minute) 3,000 $0.018 $0.03 $90.00 $0.02 $45.00

Fed Universal Serv Fund $0.0028

Total Charge $0.0208 $62.42

Measured Service Business 

Line Local Calling Cost (per 

Call) 500 $0.026 $0.04 $20.00 $0.00 $0.00

Toll Free Service (Monthly) $5.95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Fed Universal Serv Fund $1.47

Total Charge $7.44 $3,720.50

Toll Free Service Usage 

Charges, NH LATA Charges 

(per Minute) 12000 $0.018 $0.06 $720.00 $0.03 $360.00

Fed Universal Serv Fund $0.0028

Total Charge $0.0208 $249.60

Toll Free Service Usage 

Charges, InterLATA Charges 

(per Minute) 1200 $0.018 $0.06 $72.00 $0.03 $36.00

Fed Universal Serv Fund $0.0028

Total Charge $0.0208 $24.96
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ISDN BRI Circuit/Line Monthly 

(Unlimited Local and US Toll 

Calling) 40 $9.99 No Bid $68.00 $2,720.00

Subscriber Line Charge $6.16

Fed Universal Serv Fund $2.04

E911  Surcharge $0.57

Fed Access Charge $1.50

Access Recovery Charge $0.73

Total Charge $20.99 $839.60

ISDN BRI Voice Mail 20 $2.95 $59.00 No Bid $8.00 $160.00

Suspension of Number 10 $6.00 $60.00 $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $150.00

Directory Assistance 500 $0.40 $200.00 $2.99 $1,495.00 $0.75 $375.00

Centrex or Equal Full Service 

Telephone Line Automated 

Attendant/Call Processor 10 $3.96 $39.60 $19.95 $199.50 $10.00 $100.00

Directory Listing (per Listing) 500 $3.00 $1,500.00 $3.15 $1,575.00 $4.25 $2,125.00

Unlisted Services (No 

Charge) 500 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Group 1 Traditional 

Telephone Line Price Total $50,188.76 $73,051.50 $65,071.00

Group 2 Legacy Line/Data 

Services

9.6K Multipoint Digital Data 

Monthly (per Point) 3 $41.90 $125.70 No Bid No Bid

19.2K Multipoint Digital Data 

Monthly (per Point) 3 $41.90 $125.70 No Bid No Bid

56K Multipoint Digital Data 

Monthly (per Point) 34 $64.45 $2,191.30 No Bid No Bid

9.6K Multipoint Analog Data 

Monthly (per Point) 3 $146.65 $439.95 No Bid No Bid

19.2K Multipoint Analog 

Data Monthly (per Point) 3 $146.65 $439.95 No Bid No Bid

56K Multipoint Analog Data 

Monthly (per Point) 10 $146.65 $1,466.50 No Bid No Bid

Protective Alarm Circuit 

Monthly 20 $32.00 $640.00 No Bid No Bid

Fire Dispatch Circuit Monthly 10 $32.00 $320.00 No Bid No Bid

Private Line Voice Monthly 20 $35.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid
Radio Circuit Monthly 20 $32.00 $640.00 No Bid No Bid

Group 2 Legacy Line/Data 

Services Total $7,089.10 $0.00 $0.00
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Group 3 Advanced 

Telephone Services

ISDN Primary Rate Interface 

Unlimited Service 40 $150.00 $296.25 $11,850.00 $275.00 $11,000.00

FCC Line Port Charge $46.01
Subscriber Line Charge $30.80

Fed Universal Serv Fund $19.48

E911  Surcharge $0.57

Fed Access Charge $17.55

Access Recovery Charge $7.20

Total Charge $271.61 $10,864.40

DID 100 Number Group 120 $5.00 $600.00 $15.00 $1,800.00 $5.00 $600.00

Toll Free Virtual Services 75 $5.95 $446.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Toll Free Virtual Services per 

Minute-in-State 100,000 $0.018 $1,800.00 $0.00 $0.02 $2,000.00

Toll Free Virtual Services per 

Minute-Inter-LATA 10,000 $0.018 $180.00 $0.00 $0.012 $120.00

Directory Assistance 5,000 $0.40 $2,000.00 $0.00 $0.75 $3,750.00

Unlisted Services 100 $3.22 $322.00 $0.00 $1.75 $175.00

SIP 100 Channel Unlimited 

Service 1 $450.00 $0.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

E911 Charge $14.25

Total $464.25 $464.25
SIP 200 Channel Access 1 $600.00 $0.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00

E911 Charge $14.25

Total $614.25 $614.25
SIP 300 Channel Access 1 $700.00 $0.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00

E911 Charge $14.25

Total $714.25 $714.25
SIP 400 Channel Access 1 $800.00 $0.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00

E911 Charge $14.25

Total $814.25 $814.25
SIP 500 Channel Access 1 $900.00 $0.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

E911 Charge $14.25

Total $914.25 $914.25
Additional telephone 

number directory listing (1st 

Free) monthly 500 $4.00 $2,000.00 $0.00 $4.25 $2,125.00

Group 3 Advanced 

Telephone Services Total $21,733.90 non-compliant $29,570.00
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Group 5 High Speed 

(Broadband) Internet 

Service Provider 

DSL ISP Connection 3M 

Download/ 3M Upload 

Monthly 25 $39.99 $999.75 $0.00 $125.00 $3,125.00

High Speed Cable Modem 

Monthly 50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Fiber Optic Monthly 5 $44.99 $224.95 $0.00 $350.00 $1,750.00

Satellite Monthly 50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Non-compliant
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