
SEC A TOTAL SEC B TOTAL SEC C TOTAL SEC D TOTAL SEC E TOTAL SEC F TOTAL SEC G TOTAL SEC H TOTAL SEC I TOTAL SEC J TOTAL
Belknap Carroll Cheshire Coos Grafton Hillsborough Merrimack Rockingham Strafford Sullivan

ASNE 57.02 67.34 74.60 84.50 85.23 58.70 52.88 48.63 60.34 60.52
POWERS 73.11 79.55 93.49 63.79 74.63 75.51 77.78 60.34 66.84 89.29
GEMINI ELECTRIC (AKA: POWER UP) 79.52 96.37 96.37 68.63 94.82 79.37 69.77 71.35 80.34 85.08
KINSLEY POWER SYSTEMS 95.46 91.08 93.33 95.46 95.46 79.28 78.02 72.67 72.13 76.25
SCHERBON CONSOLIDATED (SCI) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 73.72 81.65 NO BID
TRISTATE GENERATOR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 96.70 94.47 96.70 94.45 NO BID
THE GENERATOR CONNECTION NO BID 77.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID 58.97 NO BID 56.28 63.02 60.68
WELD POWER GENERATOR SERVICE 50.75 NO BID 70.90 NO BID NO BID 53.95 56.80 53.71 51.87 NO BID
FM GENERATOR 78.74 74.53 76.45 59.79 85.57 73.36 94.74 87.15 94.74 94.74
PG&E OF NEW ENGLAND 63.25 62.69 58.85 NO BID 60.42 44.27 51.95 46.95 NO BID 51.86

SEC A SEC B SEC C SEC D SEC E SEC F SEC G SEC H SEC I SEC J **HOURLY
ASNE $62,917.50 $16,284.75 $12,279.75 $29,538.00 $40,751.25 $70,980.00 $197,648.25 $57,423.00 $27,468.00 $5,262.75 $18,000.00
POWERS $51,060.00 $14,610.00 $10,140.00 $47,610.00 $53,200.00 $57,270.00 $133,290.00 $49,410.00 $27,220.00 $3,540.00 $12,525.00
GEMINI ELECTRIC (AKA: POWER UP) $42,945.00 $10,875.00 $9,315.00 $39,900.00 $37,045.00 $50,460.00 $144,210.00 $36,255.00 $19,935.00 $3,570.00 $15,300.00
KINSLEY POWER SYSTEMS $33,900.00 $11,505.00 $9,570.00 $26,061.00 $36,326.00 $49,812.00 $123,108.00 $34,839.00 $22,501.00 $4,035.00 $16,200.00
SCHERBON CONSOLIDATED (SCI) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $34,755.00 $19,535.00 NO BID $15,300.00
TRISTATE GENERATOR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39,735.00 $99,020.00 $24,915.00 $16,400.00 NO BID $15,000.00
THE GENERATOR CONNECTION NO BID $13,650.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $70,200.00 NO BID $46,800.00 $25,850.00 $5,220.00 $18,300.00
WELD POWER GENERATOR SERVICE $72,321.00 NO BID $12,927.00 NO BID NO BID $78,120.00 $176,862.00 $49,266.00 $33,017.00 NO BID $18,900.00
FM GENERATOR $42,375.00 $14,550.00 $12,075.00 $46,275.00 $41,025.00 $54,225.00 $96,264.00 $27,525.00 $15,939.00 $3,066.00 $17,000.00
PG&E OF NEW ENGLAND $55,650.00 $18,060.00 $16,812.00 NO BID $63,309.00 $106,845.00 $205,760.00 $61,470.00 NO BID $6,570.00 $17,250.00

Indicates award made to this bidder:

**Repair/ Emergency Service Hourly Assumptions for evaluation calculations: Formula Legend
Preventative Maintenance - Sections A - J/Counties = 80%

100 Hours Repairs - Section K Hourly  = 20%
30 Hours To calculate weighted points:
10 Hours Divide lowest bidder's total by other bidder's total and then multiply by the weighted percentage
10 Hours Add the two weighted points (Counties + Hourly) together for the total

Ex. Gemini - Sec C
$9,315.00 / $9,315.00 = 1 x .8 = .8 x 100 = 80
$12,525.00/$15.300.00 = .818 x .20 = .1637 x 100 = 16.37
80 x 16.37 = 96.37

POINTS

PRICE TOTALS

Statewide

STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE
Bureau of Purchase and Property

Bid #1874-17
June 24, 2016 @ 1:30PM

Generator Maintenance & Repair Services

Monday thru Friday 7:00 A.M. to 4:00 P.M.
Monday thru Friday 4:01 P.M. to 6:59 A.M.

Saturday Work
Sunday & Holiday* Work

*Holidays shall be based on State designated holidays
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