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CONTRACT: CONTRACT -Reflective & Non-Reflective Sheeting
CONTRACT #: 8001455 -3M
8001456 - Osburn Associates
8001457 - Nippon Carbide

SUBMITTED FOR ACCEPTANCE BY:

~.

LORETTA RAZIN, PURCHASING AGENT DATE IO“ 3 1\ 1S

BUREAU OF PURCHASE AND PROPERTY
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ENDORSED FOR ACCEPTANCE BY:

ENDORSED BY: M/ / )ﬂ dZa+ DATE /%73/// 3

CHAEL P. CONN/OR DEPUTY COMMISSIONER
PLANT AND PROPERTY MGT.
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ACCEPTED FOR THE STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE UNDER THE AUTHORITY GRANTED TO ME BY NEW
HAMPSHIRE REVISED STATUTES, ANNOTATED 21-1:14, XIL.

O‘%D (Yol DATE Lo] 33/13—

LINDA M. HODGDON, COMMISSIONER
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES

%( NOTES: This contract is in result of NH Bid 1514-14 for statewide contracts for reflective and-non--———-—

reflective sheeting. This contract will be in effect 11/1/2013 through 08/30/2016 with 2 one year
extensions. | have worked with Dept of Corrections and Dept of Transportation for re-writing of bid
specifications for certification and performance requirements.






state of New Hampshire Date: July 24, 2013
Dlvision of Plant and Property Management

Bureau of Purchase and Property Bld No.! 15714-14
25 Capltol Street, State House Annex :
Concord, NH 03301-6398 Date of Bld Opening: August 5, 2013

Time of Bid Opening: 1:30 PM (EST)

YOU MAY EMAIL YOUR BID TO LORETTA HEAD AT: EMAIL PRCHWEB@NH.GOV
~ Orlif needed, FAX No. 403/ 271-7564

BID INVITATION FOR CONTRACT: Reflective & Non-Reflective Sheeting

Dear Loreita: Nippon Carbide
(insert name of signor] drew Kato onbehalfof _Industries (USA) insert name of entity submitting bid

(collectively referred to as “Vendor") hereby submits an offer as contained in the written bid submitted herewith ["Bid")-to the State of New
Hampshire in response to BID #1§14-14 at the price(s) quoled herein in complete accordance with the bid,

Vendor attests to the fact that:

The Yendor has reviewed and agreed to be bound by the Bid.

The Yendor has not altered any of the language or other provisions contained in the Bid document,

The Bid I5 effective for a perlod of 180 days from the Bid Opening date as Indicated above.,

The prices Vendor has quoted in the Bid were established without collusion with other vendors.

The Vendor has read and fully understands this Bid.

_ Further, in accordance with RSA 21-1:11-c, tho undersigned Yendor certifies that neither the Vendor nor any of its subsidiaries, affiliates or

principal officers {principal officers refers to individuals wilh management responsibliity for the entity or association);

a. Has, within the past 2 years, been convicted of, or pleaded gullty to, a violation of RSA 356:2, RSA 3564:4, or any state or federal law
or county or municipal ordinance prohibiling specified bidding practices, or involving antitrust violations, which has not been
annulled;

b. Hasbeen prohibitad, either permanently or temporaiily, from parficipating in any public works project pursuant to RSA 638:20;

c. Has previously provided false, deceptive, or fraudulent information on vendor code number application form, or any other
document submitted to the state of New Hampshire, which Informalion was not comected as of the time of the filing o bid,
proposal, or quotation;

d. s currently dobarred from perferming work on any project of the federal governmant or the government of any state;

e. Has, within the past 2 years, failed to cure a defoult on any contract with the federal government or the govemment of any state;

f.  Ispresently subject to any order of the department of labor, the department of erployment securily, or any other state
department, agency. board, or commission, finding Ihat the applicant Is not in compliance with the reguirements of the laws or
rules that the department, agency, board, or commission is charged with implementing:

g. s presently subject to any sanction or penalty finally Issued by the depariment of labor, the department of employment security, or
any other state department, agency, board, or commission, which sanction or penalty has not been fully discharged or [ulfilled;

h. Is currently serving a senfence or is subject to o conlinuing or unfulfilled penalty for any crime or violafion noted in this section:

i, Has failed or neglected to advise the division of any conviction, plea of gullly, or finding relalive to any crime or violation noted in
this section, or of any debarment, within 30 days of such conviction, plea. finding, or dabarment; or

| Has been placed on the debarred parties list described in RSA 21-1:11-¢ within the past year,.

Il

This document must be signed by a person who is autherized to legally obligate the responding vendor. A signature on this document
indicates that all State of New Hampshire terms and conditions are daccepled by the responding vendor and that any and all other terms
and conditions submitted by the responding vendor are null and void, even if such terms and conditions have lerminology 1o the confrary.

The responding vendor shall dalso be subject to State of New Hampshire terms and condilions as stated on the reverse of the purchase order.
Authorized Signor's Signature W Avuthorized Signor's Tile Operations Manager

NOTARY PUBLIC/JUSTICE OF THE PEACE

t::(Z)UI%IT\':D:}s Angeles STATE: cA 11P; 90670

Onthe 2__ day of _%ugust , 2013, personally appeared before me, the above named Andrew Kato _ in his/her capacity
as authorlzed representalive of _NCL USA Indnown o me or salisfaclorlly proven, and fook oalhi that the foregging s frue and accurate

to the best of his/her knowledge and bellef.

In withess thergof, | hgraunio sef iy h al seal.

{Notary Public/Ju of the Peace)
June 17,

" MARIA JULH
Commission # 1939632.,
Notary Public,- Califarnia
L.os Angeles County
Co pit '

My commission explres:
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2.0 Performance Requirements and Obligations.

2.1 Certification. The film manufacturer shall submit with each lot or shipment, a certiflcation which
states that the material supplied will meet all of the requirements listed herein. :

22 Field Performance Requirements. The Overlay film applied fo retroreflective sheeting, both
materials applied in accordance with the manufacturer's recommendations, shall as a composite perform
with the same effective performance life as the using agency specifies for that type of colored retroreflective
sheeting. The compaosite sign will be considered unsatisfactory if it has deteriorated due to natural causes to
the extent that: (1) the sign is ineffective for its Intended purpose when viewed from a moving vehicle under
normal day and night driving conditions; or (2} the coefficient of retroreflection is less than the minimums
specified by the using agency for colored retroreflective sheeting.

2.3 Overay Film Manufacturer's Replacement Obligation. Where it can be shown that retroreflective
traffic signs with Overlay fim supplied and used according to the film manufacturer's recommendations have
not met the performance requirements of Section 2.2, the film manufacturer shall cover restoration costs as
provided in the using agency specification for colored retroreflective sheeting.

2.4 Government Using Agency Obligation. The using agency shall be responsible for requiring dating
of all signs at the time of application. That date constitutes the start of the field performance obligation
period.

3.0 Technical Assistance Requirements

3.1 Instruction and Training. As requested the manufacturer supplying the Overlay film requirement
shall provide the services of a qualified technician for instruction and fraining af the primary sign
manufacturing facility designated by the agency. This Instfruction shall be availlable on a quarterly basis if
needed at no additional cost, and shall include but not be limited to, training films, material application,
equipment operation, packaging, storage and other proven sign shop practices as they apply to the Overlay
film supplied by the manufacturer, and to assure that the resulting signs can comply with the applicable
specifications. Additional on-site technical assistance by the manufacturer supplying the Overlay film shall be
provided at each of the sign shops designated in the bid Invitation. This assistance will be provided at least
once each quarter of sign production, if required '

VENDOR CONTACT INFORMATION:
The following information is for this office to be able to contact a person knowledgedable of your bid response,
and who can answer questions regarding it;

Maria Suarez 562-777-1810 800-821-4264
Contact Person h Local Telephone Number Toll Free Telephone Number
562-777-1811 __hsuarez@nikkalite.com www.nikkalite.com
Fax Number E-mail Address Company Website

_ Nippon Carbide Industries USA Inc.
Company Name

Note: To be considered, bld must be signed and notarized on front cover sheet In the space provided.




48" X 50 YARDS ¢ 0.49 4178-04KP
MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING: Nikkalite Brand NOn Reflective *Available black only

J2: POSITIONABLE PRESSURE SENSITIVE NON REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 2 MIL CAST, & YEAR DURABILITY

SIZE PRICE PER SQFT MFG, CODE NO.
4 No Bid
12" X 50 YARDS $

SECTION J . NON-REFLECTIVE PLASTIC AND VINYL FILM - CONTINUED

SIZE PRICE PER ROLL MFG. CODE NO.
15" X 50 YARDS g No Bid
24" X 50 YARDS $

30" X 50 YARDS

36" X 50 YARDS

e e s

48" X 50 YARDS

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING:

SECTION K - OVERLAY FILMS FOR USE IN RETROREFLECTIVE SHEETING PER THE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS AND
NHDOT SPECIFICATION SECTION 718 RETROREFLECTIVE SHEETING.

PRICE PER SQ FT MFG CODE NO.

0.83 100 Series
K1: OVERLAY FILM

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING: Nikkalite Brand Electronic Sign Making Film

Group K

OVERLAY FILMS
FOR USE ON RETROREFLECTIVE SHEETING

1.0 General Characteristics and Packaging.

1.1 Roll Goods. When supplied as roll goods, the Overlay film shall be of good appearance, free from
ragged edges, cracks and extraneous materials. The maximum number of splices in each roll shall be three
per 50 yards of material. Splices shall be butted. The sheeting shall be packed snugly in corrugated fiberboard
cartons, in accordance with commercially accepted standards. Each carton shall clearly stipulate the brand,
quantity, size, lot or run number, and color. Stored under normal conditions the Cverlay film as furnished shall
be suitable for use for a minimum period of one year.

1.2 Sign Faces. When supplied as a finished sign face or mounted sign, the sign face, made of Overlay
fim and retroreflective sheeting. shall comply with the appearance, specification, and good workmanship
designated by the using agency for sign faces construcled of colored retrorefleclive sheeling of the same

type.



SECTION H - ASTM D4954 - CUBE CORNER MICROPRISMATIC ~ TYPE XI

H: WIDE ANGLE PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE SHEETING FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS
- STANDARD MFG COLORS

PRICE PER SQ, FT. MFG, CODE NO.

ALL COLORS {EXCEPT FLUORESCENT) g No Bid

FLUORESCENT ORANGE

$
FLUORESCENT YELLOW $
$

FLUORESCENT YELLOW-GREEN

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING:

GROUP H NOTE: WASHERS, (To protect the sign surface from damage by bolts

or other fasteners) SCREEN INKS, PROCESS COLORS, TONERS, CLEARS AND SLIP SHEETING SHALL BE SPECIFICALLY
FORMULATED FOR USE WITH THOSE SHEETINGS IN GROUP C AND SHALL

BE SUPPLIED AT NO CHARGE. See Group H for not mark-ups

SECTION 1 - MARKINGS FOR VEHICLE CONSPICUITY AS PER NHTSA AMENDMENT FMVSS#108
(49CFR571)SPECIFICATIONS

11: WIDE ANGLE PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE SHEETING FOR USE ON VEHICLES

PRICE PER $Q. FT. MFG. CODE NO.
RED AND WHITE g 265 96515
WHITE g No Bid

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING: Nikkalite Brand

SECTION'J - NON-REFLECTIVE PLASTIC AND VINYL FILM

J1: PRESSURE SENSITIVE NON REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 2 MIL CAST, 8 YEAR DURABILITY

SIZE PRICE PER SQFT MFG. CODE NO.
g 0.49 4178-04Kp

0.49

12" X 50 YARDS $
0.49

15" X 50 YARDS $

24" X 50 YARDS ¢ 0-49

30" X 50 YARDS $ i

36" X 50 YARDS g 0.49




SECTION F - ASTM D4956 - WIDE ANGLE PRISMATIC ~ TYPE VIII
F: WIDE ANGLE PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE SHEETING FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS

- STANDARD MFG COLORS
PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODE NO.
ALL COLORS (EXCEPT FLUORESCENT) $_3.65 92000 Series
FLUORESCENT ORANGE g 2.45 92847
FLUORESCENT YELLOW 3 to Bic
FLUORESCENT YELLOW-GREEN g 415 92844

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING;_ Nikkalite Brand Crystal Grade Prismatic

GROUP F NOTE: WASHERS, (To protect the sign surface from damage by bolts

or other fasteners) SCREEN INKS, PROCESS COLORS, TONERS, CLEARS AND SLIP SHEETING SHALL BE SPECIFICALLY
FORMULATED FOR USE WITH THOSE SHEETINGS IN GROUP F AND SHALL

BE SUPPLIED AT NO CHARGE.

SECTION G - ASTM_D4956 - CUBE CORNER MICROPRISMATIC — TYPE IX
G: WIDE ANGLE PRISMATIC RETROREFLECTIVE SHEETING FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS

- STANDARD MFG COLORS
PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODE NO.
ALL COLORS (EXCEPT FLUORESCENT) g NoBid
FLUORESCENT ORANGE $
FLUORESCENT YELLOW $
FLUORESCENT YELLOW-GREEN sl

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING:

GROUP G NOTE: WASHERS, (To protect the sign surface from damage by bolts

or other fasteners) SCREEN INKS, PROCESS COLORS, TONERS, CLEARS AND SLIP SHEETING SHALL BE SPECIFICALLY
| FORMULATED FOR USE WITH THOSE SHEETINGS IN GROUP C AND SHALL
BE SUPPLIED AT NO CHARGE, See Group G for nol mark-ups



SECTION D - ASTM D4954- TYPE IV ~HIGH INTENSITY GRADE — MICROPRISMATIC LENS REFLECTIVE SHEETING

D1: PRESSURE SENSITIVE ADHESIVE ROLL GOODS
PRICE PER SQ. FT, ' MFG. CODE NO.

PRESSURE SENSITIVE $ No Bid

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING:

GROUP D NOTE:

1. WASHERS To protect the sign surface from damage by bolts or other fasteners shall be supplied at no
charge.

2. All colors provided under group A will be af the same price.

3. SCREEN INKS, PROCESS COLORS, TONERS, CLEARS AND SLIP SHEETING SHALL BE SPECIFICALLY FORMULATED
FOR USE WITH THOSE SHEETINGS IN GRQUP D AND SHALL 8E SUPPLIED AT NO CHARGE. ~ This may not apply to Tralfic
but may apply lo the prison.

SECTION E -~ SHEETING FOR VEHICLE MARKING AS PER THE ATTACHED MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS

ET; ENCLOSED LENS VEHICLE MARKINGS- REMOVYEABLE AND NON-REMOVEABLE

REMOVEABLE: PRICE PER $Q. FT. MFG. CODE NO.
WHITE: ¢ No Bid

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING:

E2: NON-REMOVEABLE: PRICE PER SQ. FT. MEG. CODE NO.
WHITE: s 0.95 48-012P
COLORS: $ 0.95 48000 Series

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING: Nikkalite Brand Flesible EG

GROUP E NOTE; SCREEN INKS, PROCESS COLORS, TONERS, CLEARS AND SLIP SHEETING SHALL BE SPECIFICALLY
FORMULATED FOR USE WITH THOSE SHEETINGS IN GROUP E AND SHALL BE SUPPLIED AT NO CHARGE




C2:  NON-SIGNING APPLICATION, FLEXIBLE TYPE Ill ENCAPULSATED LENS REFLECTIVE SHEETING FOR
REBOUNDABLE PLASTIC TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES - STANDARD MFG COLORS

PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODE NO.
$ 1.75 CS500 Series

MANUFACTURER’S BRAND NAME QUOTING:_ Nikkalite Brand Ultralite Grade IT

APPLICATION TAPE
PAPER: PRICE PER SQ.. FT. MFG. CODE NO.
$ 0.25 6592
CLEAR FILM: PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODE NO.
g 0.25 1310

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING: _ Transferite

C3: TYPE Il ENCAPULSATED LENS REFLECTIVE SHEETING FOR RIGID SUBSTRATE SIGNS
AND BARRICADES IN THE CONSTRUCTION WORK ZONE- STANDARD MFG COLORS

PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODE NO.

g 1.52 CN500 Series

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING:__ Nikkalite Brand Ultralite Grade II

APPLICATION TAPE
PAPER: PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODE NO.

s 0.25 6592
CLEAR FILM: PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODE NO.

: 0.25 1310

Tr.
MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING: ansferite _

GROUP C NOTE:

WASHERS, (To protect the sign surface from damage by bolts or other fasteners) SCREEN INKS, PROCESS
COLORS, TONERS, CLEARS AND SLIP SHEETING SHALL BE SPECIFICALLY FORMULATED FOR USE WITH THOSE
SHEETINGS IN GROUP C AND SHALL BE SUPPLIED AT NO CHARGE,



ECTI B . ASTM D4956-1 -~ SUPER ENGINEERING GRADE - ENCLOSED LENS GLASS BEAD REFLE
SHEETING

PRESSURE SENSITIVE ADHESIVE ROLL GOODS
PRICE PER SQ2, FT. MFG. CODE NG,

0.9
PRESSURE SENSITIVE 5 5 15000 Series

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME GUOTING,___Tkkalite Brand Super Engineering Grade

APPLICATION TAPE
PAPER: PRICE PER $Q. FT. MFG. CORE NO.
R 0.25 6592
CLEAR FLM: PRICE PER SQ. FT, MFG, CODE NO.,
$ 0.25 1310

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING:___ Transferite

GROUP B NOTE; .

WASHERS {To protect the sign surface from damage by bolts or other fasteners), SCREEN INKS, PROCESS
COLORS, TONERS, CLEARS AND SLIP SHEETING SHALL BE SPECIFICALLY FORMULATED FOR USE WITH THOSE
SHEETINGS IN GROUF B AND SHALL

BE SUPPLIED AT NO CHARGE, .

SE - 956-1 ~HIGH INTENSITY GRADE ~E P ED LENS REFLECTIVE §

Nofe: Type Ill High Intenslty Grade Prismatic Sheeting can be used in replacement of Type Hi Kigh Intensity as
long s It meets ASTM D4956 Type Il requirements, Vendors must note [f thelr price Is for Type Il prismatic
sheeting.

C1: PRESSURE SENSITIVE ADHESIVE ROLL GOODS ~ RIGID SIGN APPLICATION

PRICE PER SQ. FT, MFG. CODE NO,
PRESSURE SENSITIVE g 1.48 #N500 Series

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING:___ Nikkalite Brand Ultralite Grade IT

APPLICATION TAPE
PAPER: PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODENO.
" 0.25 6592
CLEAR FiLM; PRICE PER $Q. FT. MFG, CODE NO.
4 0.25 1310

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING: Transferite

]




Agency obligatien: the using agency shall be responsible for dating all the signs at the time of application of
sheeling, That date conslitutes the start of the cerflilication and pedormance requirements,

Matched Components:

The State reserves the right to mateh sheeting manufacture material for any type background being used, For
example: Manufacture A is awarded Type |V and Manufacture B is awarded Type XI. The Stale chooses to
make a sign with Type IV background and Type XI copy. The State will have the abllity to use Manufacture A
Type Xl sheeting for construction of this sign.

Catalogs/Price Llsts:

All bidders must submit an appropriate catalog and price Iist for all groups they are bidding on. Successful
vendors will supply appropriate catalogs and price lists to agencles that request them, The successful vendor
shall furnish a master price list indicating the manutaciurers part number description slze and price perroll,
using the awarded prices .

MINIMUM ORDER:
There will be ho minimum order whether In item gquantity or dollar value assoclated with any contract resulting

from this bid.

DELIVERY LOCATIONS:

The following cre the current State of New Hampshlre agency/Institution locations which, If you are awarded a
confract, you are expected to service, The State of New Hampshire reserves the right fo add locations to this list
at the conlract prices or to delete locatlons, as needed. This listing does not include any eligible participants,

OFFER;

Bidder hereby offers to furnish reflectlive and non-reflective sheeting 1o State of New Hampshire agencies and
institutlons and to any political sub-division and authorized non-profit organization wishing to perticlpate, In
accordance with all of the requirements of this bld Invitation at the following ptices for the entire contract term
and any extension,

SECTION A . ASTM D4956 - TYPE | - ENGINEERING GRADE ~ ENCLOSED LENS GLASS BEAD REFLECTIVE
SHEETING -
PRESSURE SENSITIVE ADHESIVE ROLL GOODS
PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODE NO.
0.76 #8100 Series

PRESSURE SENSITIVE 3

MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING;_ ikkalite Brand Engineering Crade

APPLICATION TAPE
PAPER: PRICE PER SQ. FT. MFG. CODE NO.
g 0.25 6592
CLEAR FILM; PRICE PER SQ. FT, MFG. CODE NO.
¢ 0.25 1310
MANUFACTURER'S BRAND NAME QUOTING;___ Transferite
GROUP A NOTE:

1. WASHERS To protect the sign surface from damage by bolts or other fasteners shall be supplied at no
charge.

2. All colors provided under group A wilk be at the same price.

3., SCREEN INKS, PROCESS COLORS, TONERS, CLEARS AND SLIP SHEETING SHALL BE SPECIFICALLY FORMULATED
FOR USE WITH THOSE SHEETINGS IN GROUP A AND SHALL BE SUPPLIED AT NO CHARGE,
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