CONTRACT:

CONTRACT NO.:

NIGP CODE:

VENDOR:

CONTACT PERSON:
CELL PHONE:
FACSIMILE:

E-MAIL:

EFFECTIVE FROM:

TERMS:

PRODUCTS & PRICES:

DELIVERY TIME:

F.O.B.:

ORDERING:

MINIMUM ORDERS:

Questions:

STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE
DEPT. OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
DIV. OF PLANT AND PROPERTY MANAGEMENT
BUREAU OF PURCHASE AND PROPERTY
STATE HOUSE ANNEX
CONCORD, NEW HAMPSHIRE 03301

DATE: 8/22/14

NOTICE OF CONTRACT
(STATE WIDE CONTRACT)

GRATES & FRAMES
8001594

890-3000

NEENAH FOUNDRY
PO BOX 9406

2121 BROOKS AVENUE
NEENAH WI 94956

VDR # 169284 BOO1

LESA GIRARD

603-545-7244

603-509-2428
lesa.girard@neenahenterprises.com
SEPTEMBER 1, 2014 THROUGH: AUGUST 31, 2016
NET-30

SEE ATTACHED

7 WORKING DAYS ARO

FOB DESTINATION

SEE INSTRUCTIONS BELOW

PRICES QUOTED ARE AVAILABLE TO ALL POLITICAL SUB-DIVISIONS OF THE STATE OF NEW
HAMPSHIRE AS COVERED UNDER RSA 21-I:17. POLITICAL SUB-DIVISIONS, CITIES AND TOWNS

TO CONTACT VENDOR DIRECTLY

NONE

Bob Lawson, Purchasing Agent

Phone: 603-271-3147
E-Mail: bob.lawson@nh.gov




ABILITY TO PROVIDE:
Successful Vendor must be capable of providing each State of New Hampshire agencies and eligible
participants with their entire requirements of the items required in this contract without any delay or substitution.

ORDERING PROCEDURE:

State agencies and institutions shall place their orders by first obtaining a quote from the Contractor. Orders
may be placed direct to Contractor using a Field Purchase Order if the total amount of the order is less than
$500. The Bureau of Purchase and Property will issue purchase orders on behalf of State Agencies for orders
over $500. Any changes to these Purchase Orders must be authorized by the Bureau or Purchase and Property.

Cities, Counties, Towns, Political sub-divisions and authorized non-profit organizations shall utilize their own
individually established ordering procedures.

DELIVERY TIME:
Contractor will be required to accomplish delivery of any item ordered under the contract within seven (7)
working days from the placement of the order.

The use of a private carrier to make delivery does not relieve the Contractor from the responsibility of
meeting the delivery requirement.

RETURNED GOODS:

Contractor must resolve all order and invoice discrepancies within ten business days from nofification.
Products returned due to quality issues, duplicate shipments, over-shipments, etc. must be picked up by the
Conftractor within five business days of nofification with no restocking or freight charges, and must be
replaced with specified products or the agency will be refunded/credited for the full purchase price.
Unauthorized substitutions for any products are not allowed.

Standard stock products ordered in error by the State of New Ham pshire must be returned for full credit
within fifteen days of receipt. Products must be in re-saleable condition (original container, unused) and
there will be no restocking fee charged for these products. The using agency will be responsible for any
freight charges to return these items to the Contractor.

INVOICING:

Invoicing shall be done to the Agency Remit Account on the basis of each order completed. Invoices shall
clearly indicate the quantity, description, packaging, date delivered, and contract price. Invoicing for eligible
participants will be in accordance with their individual requirements.

WARRANTY REQUIREMENTS:

Contractor shall be required to warranty all of the equipment awarded to Contractor for a period of not less
than the manufacturer’s standard period of time, from the date the items are received, inspected and
accepted by the State of New Hampshire. The warranty shall cover 100% of all parts, shipping. labor, travel,
lodging and expenses.

MINIMUM ORDER:
There will be no minimum order whether in item quantity or dollar value.

VENDOR'S BALANCE OF PRODUCT LINE ITEMS

The Items in the following pricing listing are the items most commonly purchased by the State however,
during the term of the contract the , the state may wish to purchase other Grates and Frames or related
items from the Contractor as part of their Balance of Product Line. Any Balance of Product Line items shall
be priced using the same discount or mark-up structure as the items in the following pricing list and shall be
governed by all the same terms and conditions as the items in the following pricing listing.



SPECIFICATIONS

SPECIFICATIONS:

MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS & NEW HAMPSHIRE STANDARDS FOR GRATES AND FRAMES:

All castings furnished must be of minimum class 30 - 30,000 Ib. iron.

All grates, frames, manhole covers, etc are to be manufactured in the United States of America.

All dimensions will be as shown on New Hampshire standard sheets DR-1 DR-2 AND SL-1 with a tolerance of plus
or minus one (1) percent. Copies of these sheets are attached.

AASHTO M 105 will govern quality of finish and workmanship unless otherwise specified. Prefabricated metal
adjustment rings for catch basins, drop inlets and manholes shall conform to AASHTO M 105 also.

Each heat must be certified to be minimum class 30 iron by a domestic laboratory acceptable to the
Department of Transportation, Chief Materials and Research Engineer.

Steel grates shall be of structural steel conforming to AASHTO M 183M/M 183(ASTM A 36/A 36M). All grates shall
be fabricated as shown on plans or as approved. All top edges shall be flush, and all rivets must be tight and
properly headed. After fabrication, the grates shall be galvanized in accordance with AASHTO M 111 or ASTM
A 153 as applicable.

Each casting shipment must be accompanied by a statement on the contractor's stationery guaranteeing that
proper certification of the casting material has taken place.

The State reserves the right to test castings at random.

The State reserves the right to inspect laboratory certifications at its discretion.

Test costs will be borne by the State if castings tested meet the specifications of this proposal.

Should any castings fail, the costs of the test will be borne by the Contractor.

All castings from the heat of a casting that fail to meet the minimum class 30 strength requirements will
immediately be returned to the vendor without penalty. Castings already in the ground accepted.

The State reserves the right to demand immediate replacement of any component purchased from this
contract that do not meet specifications

If the ASTM or AASHTO standard should change or be superseded, the most recent ASTM or AASHTO standard
shall apply



LINE ITEM # | VENDOR PART ITEM DESCRIPTION Neenah
# Foundry
] 3571-2000 TYPE B FRAMES 120.00
THREE FLANGE
2 3570-2000 TYPE B FRAME 120.00
FOUR FLANGE
3 3570-0002 TYPE B GRATE 86.00
MINIMUM CLASS
30 CAST IRON
4 3571-0002 TYPEB LOW 99.00
3" FLANGE
5 3570-0003 TYPE B LOW 107.00
PROFILE 4" FLANGE
6 3266-0001 TYPE E FRAME 153.00
7 3266-0002 TYPE E GRATES 232.00
8 3589-2004 TYPE F FRAME - 8" 140.00
3 FLANGE
9 3588-2004 TYPE F GRATE-8" - 133.00
4 FLANGE
10 3588-3010 or TYPE F GRATE -
3588-3020 CASCADE 148.00
MACHINED SEAT
11 1743-2000 MANHOLE FRAME 117.00
12 1743-5006 MANHOLE COVER -
LID 125.00
DRAIN
13 1743-5000 MANHOLE COVER -
LID 125.00

SEWER

4




14

1743-5007

MANHOLE COVER -
LID

DRAIN
NO LETTERING

125.00

15

R-1878-A2L

PULL BOX FRAME
AND COVER 16 X 3

80.00

16

3588-2004

TYPE A FRAME

133.00

17

R-4215-A

CONVEX (BEEHIVE)
GRATE

(HEAVY
DUTY) (COMPARABLE

TO NEENAH ITEM # R-
4215-A

CONVEX GRATE)

220.00




STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE

DEPT. OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
BUREAU OF PURCHASE AND PROPERTY

INTER-DEPARTMENT COMMUNICATION

DATE: JULY 31, 2014

FROM: Robert B. Lawson, Purchasing Agent
Bureau of Purchase & Property

TO: Robert D. Stowell
Michael P. Connor
Linda M. Hodgdon

SUBJECT: AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR GRATES AND FRAMES

Attached for your approval is the contract document for a Statewide contract for Grates
and Frames, which we are recommending. This contract will run for a period of
approximately 24 months until 8/31/16.

This recommendation is based on an evaluation of responses to State’s RFB #1652-15 for
a Contract for Grates & Frames.

Commissioner’s signature is requested below.

PROPOSEWMMMENDED :
ROBERT B. LAWSON—_ RQEERT D. s?zf ,
MINISTR A

et

PURCHASING AGENT,

WELL
OR
PURCHASE & PROPERTY ‘" PURCHASE & PROPERTY
DATE PROPOSED: 3/ DATE RECOMMENDED: ? 5// //

ENDORSED BY: __+Z/ f.(Zf,-L/ / ééfz’:ff/)’ APPROVED BY:@@ M%\

MICHAEL P. CONNOR " LINDA M. HODGDON
DEPUTY COMMISSIONER, COMMISSIONER,
DEPT. OF ADM. SERV. DEPT. OF ADM. SERV.

DATE APPROVED: 9{ S Zl}’

DATE ENDORSED: 475 /"



7/28/12014 RBL

RFB 1662-16

Statewide Contract for Grates and Frames

DESCRIPTION
LINE ITEM # VENDOR PART ESTIMATED ITEM DESCRIPTION EJ Prescott Ferguson
# ANNUAL USEAGE Water Works
(EACH)
1 5 TYPE B FRAMES 667.50 $ 763.35
THREE FLANGE
2 25 TYPE B FRAME 3,450.00 § 4,089.75
FOUR FLANGE
3 0 TYPE B GRATE 7.965.00 $ 8,202.60
MINIMUM CLASS
30 CAST IRON
4 5 TYPE B LOW 52250 § 603.75
3" FLANGE
5 50 TYPE B LOW 565000 $ 6,210.50
PROFILE 4" FLANGE
6 30 TYPE E FRAME 6,600.00 NO BID
7 30 TYPE E GRATES 5,025.00 NO BID
8 5 TYPE F FRAME — 8" 887.50 $ 1,063.80
3 FLANGE
? 5 TYPE F GRATE - 8" 997.50 $ 1,121.30
4 FLANGE
10 10 TYPE F GRATE -
CASCADF 164500 $ 1,610.00
MACHINED SEAT
11 10 MANHOLE FRAME 1,170.00 $ 1,380.00
12 5 MANHOLE COVER
—1n 672.50 § 891.30
DRAIN
13 5 MANHOLE COVER
—11ID 67250 $ 891.30
SEWER
14 5 MANHOLE COVER
~-11D 67250 § 891.30
DRAIN
NO LETTERING
15 5 PULL BOX FRAME 1,257.50 NO BID
AND COVER 16 X 3
16 - 30 TYPE A FRAME 5985.00 $ 6,727.80
17 10 CONVEX (BEEHIVE)
GRATF 3,100.00 NO BID
(HEAVY
DUTY)({COMPARAB
IF
TO NEENAH ITEM #
R-4215-A
CONVEX GRATE]

46,940.00




System for Award Management
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Current Search Terms: neenah* foundry*
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.

state of New Hampshire Date: 7/7/14
Division of Plant and Property Management

Bureau of Purchase and Property Bid No.: 1652-15

25 Capitol Street, State House Annex

Concord, NH 03301-56398 Date of Bid Opening: 7/28/14
Time of Bid Opening: 11:30 AM

YOU MAY EMAIL YOUR BID TO ROBERT LAWSON AT: EMAIL PRCHWEB@NH.GOV

BID INVITATION FOR CONTRACT: GRATES AND FRAMES
(Insert name of signor]s LU e minaq & on behalf of N g gas [insert name of entity submitting bid
(collectively referred to as "Vendor"] hereby sBymits an offer as contained in the written submitted herewith (“Bid") to the State of New

Hampshire in response to BID # 14652-15 at the price(s) quoted herein in complete accordance with the bid.
Vendor attests to the fact that:

The Vendor has reviewed and agreed to be bound by the Bid.

The Vendor has not altered any of the language or other provisions contained in the Bid document.

The Bid is effective for a period of 180 days from the Bid Opening date as indicated above.

The prices Vendor has quoted in the Bid were established without collusion with other vendaors.

The Vendor has read and fully understands this Bid.

Further, in accordance with RSA 21-1:11-¢, the undersigned Vendor certifies that neither the Vendor nor any of its subsidiaries, affiliates or
prmmpol officers (principal officers refers to individuals with management responsibility for the entify or association):

a. Has, within the past 2 years, been convicted of, or pleaded guilty to, a violation of RSA 356:2, RSA 356:4, or any state or federal law or
county or municipal ordinance prohibiting specified bidding practices, or involving anfitrust violations, which has not been annulled:

b. Has been prohibited, either permanently or tempaorarily, from participating in any public works project pursuant fo RSA 638:20;

c. Has previously provided false, deceptive, or fraudulent information on a vendor code number application form, or any other
document submitted to the state of New Hampshire, which information was not corrected as of the time of the filing a bid, proposal,
or quotation;

d. Is curently debarred from performing work on any project of the federal government or the government of any state;

e. Has, within the past 2 years, failed to cure a default on any confract with the federal government or the government of any state;

Is presently subject to any order of the department of labor, the department of employment security, or any other state department,

agency, board, or commission, finding that the applicant is not in compliance with the requirements of the laws or rules that the

department, agency, board, or commission is charged with implementing;

g. s presently subject to any sanction or penalty finally issued by the department of laber, the depariment of employment security, or
any other state department, agency, board, or commission, which sanction or penalty has not been fully discharged or fulfilled;

h. Is currently serving a sentence or is subject to a continuing or unfulfiled penalty for any crime or viclation noted in this section;

i. Has failed or neglected to advise the division of any conviction, plea of guilty, or finding relative to any crime or violation noted in this
section, or of any debarment, within 30 days of such conviction, plea, finding. or debarment; or

I Has been placed on the debarred parties list described in RSA 21-1:11-c within the past year.

IRl e

—

This document must be signed by a person who is authorized to legally obligate the responding vendor. A signature on this document indicates
that all State of New Hampshire terms and conditions are accepted by the responding vendor and that any and all other terms and conditions
submitted by the responding vendor are null and void, even if such terms and conditions have terminology to the contrary. The responding

vendor shall also be subject to State of New Hampshire terms and conditions as stated on the reverse of the purchase order.
Authorized Signor's Signcﬂur@l%r;ii_’ﬂ Authorized Signor's Tite UV © Yumerc L Qh} Sales

NOTARY PUBLIC/JUSTICE OF THE PEACE K N )

COUNTY: ineb« go STATE: L1 J€e94i7 . Sy gy
On the 9 3 day of . Tml , 2014, personally appeared before me, the above named S‘i‘«-v_ (D2 (Age~ , in his/her capacity as

avthorized represeniuﬂve of M}nown to me or satisfactorily proven, and took oath that the foﬁg‘olh’g is true and accurate to the
best of his/her knowledge and belief.
p- Ceane. @ .
Q . Al

In witness thereof, | hereunto set my hand and official seal.

L lgne Peta A : \\\OTAR;, -
(Notary Public/Justice of the Peucéf’ . — -
My commission expires: _ /(?,/ / Q// Aol ____(Date) .'. O} PUBU‘G o;\%“ -::
., ‘9?)\-_. ........ - Q ‘.‘ Form P31-B
‘v‘f OF W\SQ’Q-‘

Unless specifically amended or deleted by the Division of Plant and Property Management, the lolfowing trenerdt Terms and Conditions apply to
this Bid and any resulting Purchase Order or Contract.




GENERAL CONDITIONS AND INSTRUCTIONS:

NATURE OF AND ELIGIBILITY TO RESPOND. This bid invitation is submitted in accordance with Chapter 21-1, and rules promulgated
thereunder, and constitutes a firm and binding offer. A bid may nof be withdrawn unless permission is obtained from the Bureau of
Purchase and Property.

Bids may be issued only by the Bureau of Purchase and Property and are not transferable.

SAMPLES AND DEMONSTRATIONS. When samples are required they must be submitted free of costs and will not be returned. Items left for
demonstration or evaluation purposes shall be delivered and installed free of charge and shall be removed at no cost to the State.
Demonstration units shall not be offered to the State as new equipment.

Bids. Bids must be received at the Bureau of Purchase and Property before the date and time specified for the opening. Bids must be
submitted on this bid form or exact copies and must be typed or clearly printed in ink. Corrections must be initialed. Bids are fo be made
less Federal Excise Tax and no charge for handling unless required by law.

Bids will be made available to the public after the time of award. Bid results will be given by mail only if requested in writing and
accompanied by a self-addressed, stamped business size envelope.

SPECIFICATIONS. Vendors must submit on items as specified. Proposed changes musi be submitted in writing and received at the Bureau
of Purchase and Property at least five (5) working days prior to the bid opening. Vendors shall be notified in writing if any changes to the
specifications are made.

AWARD. The award will be made to the responsible Vendor submitting a conforming bid meeting specifications at the lowest cost unless
other criteria are noted in the bid. Unless otherwise noted. the award may be made by individual items.

If there is a discrepancy between the unit price and the extension, the unit price will prevail.
When identical low bids are received the award will be made in accordance with the Administrative Rules.

Discounts will not be considered in making award but may be offered on the Invoice for earlier payment and will be applicable on the
date of completion of delivery or receipt of Invoice, whichever is later. On orders specifying split deliveries, discounts will apply on the
basis of each delivery or receipt of Invoice, whichever is later.

PATENT INFRINGEMENT. Any responding vendor who has reason to believe that any other responding vendor will violate a patent should
such responding vendor be awarded the contract shall set forth in writing, prior fo the date and time of opening, the grounds for his belief
and a detailed description of the patent.

ASSIGNMENT PROVISION. The responding vendor hereby agrees to assign all causes of action that it may acquire under the antitrust laws
of New Hampshire and the United States as the result of conspiracies, combinations, or contracts in restraint of trade which materially
affect the price of goods or services obtained by the state under this contract if so requested by the State of New Hampshire.

FEDERAL FUNDS. This Division of Plant and Property Management, under RSA 21-1:14, VIII shall assure the continuation or granting of federal
funds or other assistance not otherwise provided for by law by following the Federal Procurement Standards.

STATE'S OPTIONS: The Bureau of Purchase and Property reserves the right to reject or accept all or any part of any bid, to determine what
constitutes a conforming bid, to award the bid solely as it deems to be in the best interest of the State, and to waive imegularities that it
considers not material to the bid.

PUBLIC INFORMATION: The responding vendor hereby acknowledges that all information relating fo this bid and any resulting order
(Including but not limited to fees, coniracts, agreements and prices) are subject fo these laws of the State of New Hampshire regarding
public information.

PERSONAL LIABILITY: The responding vendor agrees that in the preparation of this bid or the execution of any resulting contract or order,
representatives of the State of New Hampshire shall incur no liability of any kind.

PROOF OF COMPLIANCE. The responding vendor may be required to supply proof of compliance with proposal specifications. When
requested, the responding vendor must immediately supply the Bureau of Purchase and Property with certified test results or cerfificates of
compliance. Where none are available, the State may require independent laboratory testing. All costs for such testing certified test
results or certificate of compliance shall be the responsibility of the responding vendor.

FORM OF CONTRACT. The terms and conditions set forth in any additional Terms and Conditions by the Bureau of Purchase and Property
are part of the bid and will apply to any contract awarded the responding vendor unless specific exceptions are taken and accepted
and will prevail over any contrary provisions in Terms and Conditions submitted by the responding vendor.

(¥ ]




CONTRACT TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. The State of New Hampshire, acting through the Division of Plant and Property Management, engages the firm or individual ('the
Vendor') to perform the services and/or sale of goods, described in the attached State documents, if any, and the Vendor's bid or
quotation, both of which are incorporated herein by reference.

2. COMPLIANCE BY VENDOR WITH LAWS AND REGULATIONS. In connection with the performance of this agreement, the Vendor shall
comply with all statutes, laws, regulations, and orders of federal, state, county or municipal authorities which shall impose any obligation
or duty upon the Vendor, including. but not limited to civil rights and equal opportunity laws.

3. TERM. The contract and all obligations of the parties thereunder, shall become effective on a specified date and shall be completed in
their entirety prior to a specified date. Any work undertaken by the Vendor prior to the effective date shall be at his sole risk and, in the
event that the contract shall not become effective, the State shall be under no obligation to reimburse the Vendor for any such work.

4, CONTRACT PRICE. The contract price, a payment schedule and a maximum limitation of price shall be as specified by the bid
invitation and the Vendor's bid. All payments shall be conditioned upon receipt, and approval by the State, of appropriate vouchers and
upon satisfactory performance by the Vendor, as determined by the State. The payment by the State of the Contract Price shall
constitute complete reimbursement to the Vendor for all expenses of any nature incurred by the Vendor in the performance by the
Vendor and complete payment for the Services. The State shall have no other liability to the Vendor.

5. DELIVERY. If the vendor fails to furnish items and/or services in accordance with all requirements, including delivery, the state may re-
purchase similar items from any other source without competitive bidding, and the original vendor may be liable to the state for any
excess costs. If a vendor is unable to complete delivery by the date specified, he must contact the using agency. However, the agency
is not required to accept a delay to the original delivery date. All deliveries are subject to inspection and receiving procedure rules as
established by the State of New Hampshire. Deliveries are not considered accepted until compliance with these rules has been
established. State personnel signatures on shipping documents shall signify only the receipt of shipments. All deliveries shall be FOB
Destination.

6. INVOICING. Allinvoices must be in triplicate showing Order Number, Unit and Extension Prices and discounts allowed. A separate
invoice shall be submitted for each order. Unless otherwise noted on the invitation to bid or purchase order, payment will not be due until
thirty (30) days after all services have been completed, or all items have been delivered, inspected and accepted or the invoice has
been received at the agency business office, whichever is later.

7. PERSONNEL.

7.1. The Vendor shall disclose in writing the names of all owners (5% or more), directors, officers, employees, agents or subcontractors who
are also officials or employees of the State of New Hampshire. Any change in this information shall be reported in writing within fifteen (15)
days of their occurrence.

7.2. The person signing this agreement on behalf of the State, or his or her delegee ('Confracting Officer") shall be the State's
representative for purposes of this agreement. In the event of any dispute conceming the interpretation of this agreement, the
Contracting Officer's decision shall be final.

8. EVENT OF DEFAULT; REMEDIES.
8.1. Any one or more of the following acts or omissions of the Vendor shall constitute an event of default hereunder ("Events of Default”):

8.1.1. failure to deliver the goods or services satisfactorily or on schedule; or

8.1.2. failure to submit any report required hereunder; or

8.1.3. failure to perform any of the other covenants and conditions of this agreement.

8.2. Upon the occurrence of any Event of Default, the State may take any one, or more, or all, of the following actions:

8.2.1. give the Vendor a written notice specifying the Event of Default and requiring it to be remedied within, in the absence of a greater
or lesser specification of time, thirty (30) days from the date of the notice; and if the Event of Default is not timely remedied, terminate this
agreement, effective two (2) days after giving the Vendor notice of termination; and

8.2.2. give the Vendor a written notice specifying the Event of Default and suspending all payments to be made under this agreement
and ordering that the portion of the Contract Price, which would otherwise accrue to the Vendor during the period from the date of such

notice until such time as the State determines that the Vendor has cured the Event of Default, shall never be paid to the Vendor; and

8.2.3. set off against any other obligation the State may owe to the Vendor any damages the State suffers by reason of any Event of
Default; and

8.2.4. treat the agreement as breached and pursue any of its remedies at law or in equity, or both.

9. WAIVER OF BREACH. No failure by the State to enforce any provisions hereof after any Event of Default shall be deemed a waiver of its
rights with regard to that Event, or any subsequent Event. No express failure of any Event of Defaulf shall be deemed a waiver of any
provision hereof. No such failure or waiver shall be deemed a waiver of the right of the State to enforce each and all of the provisions
hereof upon any further or other default on the part of the Vendor.




10. VENDOR'S RELATION TO THE STATE. In the performance of this agreement the Vendor is in all respects an independent contractor, and
is neither an agent nor an employee of the State. Neither the Vendor nor any of ifs officers, employees, agents or members shall have
authority to bind the State nor are they entitled to any of the benefits, workmen’s compensation or emoluments provided by the State to
its employees.

11. ASSIGNMENT AND SUBCONTRACTS. The Vendor shall not assign, or otherwise transfer any interest in this agreement without the prior
written consent of the State. No work reguired by this contract shall be subconiracted without the prior written consent of the State.

12. INDEMNIFICATION. The contractor shall defend, indemnify and hold harmless the State, its officers and employees, from and against
any and all losses suffered by the State, its officers and employees, and any and all claims, liabilities or penalties asserted against the
State, its officers and employees, by or on behalf of any person, on account of, based on, resulting from, arising out of {or which may be
claimed to arise out of) the acts or omissions of the Vendor. Notwithstanding the foregoing, nothing herein contained shall be deemed fo
constitute a waiver of the sovereign immunity of the State, which immunity is hereby reserved to the State. This covenant shall survive the
termination of this agreement.

12.1 PATENT PROTECTION. The seller agrees to indemnify and defend the State of New Hampshire from all claims and losses resulting from
alleged and actual patent infringements and further agrees to hold the State of New Hampshire harmless from any liability arising under
RSA 382-A:2-312(3). (Uniform Commercial Code).

13. TOXIC SUBSTANCES. In compliance with RSA 277-A known as the Workers Right to Know Act, the vendor shall provide Material Safety
Data Sheets with the delivery of any and all products covered by said law.

14. NOTICE. Any notice by a party hereto to the other party shall be deemed to have been duly delivered or given at the time of mailing
by certified mail, postage prepaid, in a United States Post Office addressed to the parties at the addresses given below.

15. AMENDMENT. This agreement may be amended, waived or discharged only by an instfrument in writing signed by the parties hereto.

16. CONSTRUCTION OF AGREEMENT AND TERMS. This agreement shall be construed in accordance with the laws of the State of New
Hampshire, and is binding upon and inures to the benefit of the parties and their respective successors and assigns.

17. ADDITIONAL PROVISIONS. The additional provisions (if any) have been set forth as Exhibit "A" hereto.
18. ENTIRE AGREEMENT. This agreement, which may be executed in a number of counterparts, each of which shall be deemed an

original, constitutes the entire agreement and understanding between the parties, and supersedes all prior agreements and
understandings relating hereto.




BID INVITATION FOR:
A CONTRACT FOR: GRATES AND FRAMES

INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDOR:

Read the entire bid invitation prior to filing it out. Complete the pricing information in the “Offer” section (the unit
price is the price for the unit of purchase required by this bid invitation {i.e. each, case, box, etc.) and all other
required information on your offer. The extension is the unit price multiplied by the quantity required by this bid
invitation. Also complete the “Vendor Contact Information” section. Finally, complete the company information
on the “"General Conditions and Instructions” page of this bid invitation, then sign the bid in the space provided
on that page.

BID SUBMITTAL

All bids must be submitted on this form or an exact copy, must be typed or clearly printed in ink and must be
received on or before the date and time specified on page 1 of this bid. Interested parties may submit a bid to
the State of New Hampshire Bureau of Purchase and Property, 25 Capitol Street, Room 102, Concord NH 03301 by
email to PRCHWEB@NH.GOV. All bids must be clearly marked with bid number, date due and purchasing agent’s
name. If you are experiencing difficulties, please call (603) 271-2201 and ask for an alternate source. IF YOU WISH
TO VERIFY YOUR BID RESPONSE HAS BEEN RECEIVED, CALL (603) 271-2201 AND ASK A PURCHASING ASSISTANT TO
CHECK ON THE STATUS OF YOUR BID RESPONSE.

GOVERNING TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

A responding bid that has been completed and signed by your representative will constitute your company's
acceptance of all State of New Hampshire terms and conditions and will legally obligate your company to these
terms and conditions.

A signed response further signifies that any terms and/or conditions that may be or have been submifted by the
Vendor are specifically null and void and are not a part of this bid invitation or any awarded purchase order,
even if said terms and/or conditions contain language to the contrary.

PUBLIC DISCLOSURE OF BID SUBMISSIONS:

Generally, all bids and proposals (including all materials submitted in connection with them, such as attachments,
exhibits and addenda) become public information upon the effective date of a resulting confract or purchase
order. However, to the extent consistent with applicable state and federal laws and regulations, as determined
by the State, including, but not limited to, RSA Chapter 21-A (the “Righi-to-Know" Law], the State will attempt to
maintain the confidentiality of portions of a bid that are clearly and properly marked by a Vendor as confidential.
Any and all information contained in or connected to a bid or proposal that a Vendor considers confidenfial
must be clearly designated in a manner that draws attention to the designation. The State shall have no
obligation to maintain the confidentiality of any portion of a bid, proposal or related material, which is not so
marked. Marking an entire bid, proposal, attachment or sections thereof confidential without taking into
consideration the public's right to know will neither be accepted nor honored by the State. Notwithstanding any
provision of this RFP/RFB to the contrary, pricing will be subject to public disclosure upon the effective date of alll
resulting contracts or purchase orders, regardless of whether or not marked as confidential. If a bid or proposal
results in a purchase order or contract, whether or not subject to approval by the Governor and Executive
Council, all material contained in, made part of, or submitted with the confract or purchase order shall be subject
to public disclosure.

If arequest is made to the State by any person or entity to view or receive copies of any portion of a bid or
proposal, and if disclosure is not prohibited under RSA 21-1: 13-a, Vendors acknowledge and agree that the State
may disclose any and all portions of the bid, proposal or related materials which is not marked as confidential. In
the case of bids, proposals or related materials that contain portions marked confidential, the State will assess
what information it believes is subject to release; notify the Vendor that the request has been made; indicate
what, if any, portions of the bid, proposal or related material will not be released; and notify the Vendor of the
date it plans to release the materials. The State is not obligated to comply with a Vendor's designation regarding
confidentiality.

By submitting a bid or proposal, the Vendor agrees that unless it obtains and provides to the State, prior to the
date specified in the notice described in the paragraph above, a court order valid and enforceable in the State
of New Hampshire, at its sole expense, enjoining the release of the requested information, the State may release
the information on the date specified in the notice without any liability to the Vendor.




PURPOSE:

The purpose of this bid invitation is to establish a contract(s) for supplying the State of New Hampshire agencies
with the item(s) indicated in the “Offer” section of this bid invitation to be ordered as needed during the term of
the contract, in accordance with the requirements of this bid invitation and any resulting contract. Items ordered
under any resulting contract must be delivered FOB destination to the location(s) indicated in the “Delivery
Locations” section of this bid invitation.

ELIGIBLE PARTICIPANTS:

Political sub-divisions (counties, cities, towns, school districts, special district or precinct, or any other governmental
organization), or any nonprofit agency under the provisions of section 501¢ of the federal internal revenue code, are
eligible to participate under this contract whenever said sub-division or nonprofit agency so desires. These entities are
autonomous and may participate at their sole discretion. In doing so, they are entitled to the prices established
under the contract. However, they are solely responsible for their association with the successful Vendor. The State of
New Hampshire assumes no liability between the successful Vendor and any of these entities.

CONTRACT TERM:

The term of the contract shall be from the date of award through 8/31/16, a period of approximately two years, The
contfract may be extended for additional periods of time thereafter under the same terms, conditions and pricing
structure upon the mutual agreement between the successful Vendor and the Bureau of Purchase and Property up
to a maximum of five years, with the approval of the Commissioner of the Department of Administrative Services.

TERMINATION:
The State of New Hampshire shall have the right to terminate the purchase contract at any time by giving the
successful Vendor a thirty {30) day written notice.

VENDOR CERTIFICATIONS:

ALL Vendors SHALL be duly registered as a Vendor authorized to conduct business in the State of New Hampshire,
Vendors shall comply with the certifications below at the fime of submission and through the term of any contract
which results from said bid. Failure to comply shall be grounds for disqualification of bid and/or the termination of
any resultant contract;

e STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE VENDOR APPLICATION: Vendor SHALL have a completed Vendor Application and
Alternate W-2 Form which SHALL be on file with the NH Bureau of Purchase and Property. See the following
website for information on obtaining and filing the required forms (no fee): hitp://das.nh.gov/purchasing.

e NEW HAMPSHIRE SECRETARY OF STATE REGISTRATION: A bid award, in the form of a contract(s), wil_ONLY be
awarded to a Vendor who is registered to do business AND in good standing with the State of New
Hampshire. Please visit the following website to find out more about the requirements for registration with the
NH Secretary of State: http://sos.nh.gov/corp div.aspx.

REQUEST FOR CHANGES AND/OR CLARIFICATION:

Any Questions must be submitted by an individual authorized to commit their organization to the Terms and
Conditions of this bid. Submissions must clearly identify the bid Number, the Vendor's name and address and
the name of the person submitting the question. Any requested changes to this bid invitation by the Vendor
must be received in writing at the Bureau of Purchase and Property no later than 4:30 PM on the (5t) fifth
business day prior to the date of the bid opening.

Questions must be submitted by E-mail to Robert Lawson at the following address: Robert.lawson@NH.GOV

ADDENDUM:

In the event it becomes necessary to add to or revise any part of this bid prior to the scheduled submittal date,
the NH Bureau of Purchase and Property will post on our web site any Addenda. Before your submission, check
the site for any addenda or other materials that may have been issued affecting the bid. The web site address is
http://das.nh.gov/purchasing.

BID PRICES:

Bid prices must be in US dollars and must include delivery and all other costs required by this bid invitation. Bid
prices should result in prices that are no higher than those charged to the Vendor's best/preferred customer.
Special charges, surcharges, or fuel charges of any kind (by whatever name) may not be added on at any time.
Any and all charges must be built into your bid price at the time of the bid.




BID RESULTS:
Bid results may be viewed when available, once the award has been made, on our web site only at:
http://das.nh.gov/purchasing.

For Vendors wishing to attend the bid Opening: Only the names of the Vendors submitting responses will be made
public.

ABILITY TO PROVIDE:

Successful Vendor must be capable of providing each State of New Hampshire agencies and eligible participants
with their enfire requirements of the items required in this bid invitation and any resulting contract without any delay
or substitution.

ORDERING PROCEDURE:

State agencies and institutions shall place their orders by first obtaining a quote from the successful vendor. Orders
may be placed direct to vendor using a Field Purchase Order if the total amount of the order is less than $500. The
Bureau of Purchase and Property will issue purchase orders on behalf of State Agencies for orders over $500. Any
changes to these Purchase Orders must be authorized by the Bureau or Purchase and Property,

Cities, Counties, Towns, Political sub-divisions and authorized non-profit organizations shall utilize their own individually
established ordering procedures.

AUDITS AND ACCOUNTING:

The successful Vendor shall allow representatives of the State of New Hampshire to have complete access to all
records for the purpose of determining compliance with the terms and conditions of this bid invitation and in
determining the award and for monitoring any resulting contract.

At intervals during the contract term, and prior to the termination of the contract, the successful Vendor may be
required to provide a complete and accurate accounting of all products and quantities ordered by each agency
and institution and by political sub-divisions and authorized non-profit organizations.

ESTIMATED CONTRACT VALUE:

The annual value of the contract is estimated to be $50,000.00. This figure is given for informational purposes only and
shall not be considered a guaranteed or minimum figure, nor shall it be considered a maximum figure. This figure
does not include any eligible participant figures.

ESTIMATED USAGE:

The quantities indicated in the offer section of this bid invitation are an estimate only for the State of New Hampshire's
annual requirements. These quantities are indicated for informational purposes only and shall not be considered
minimum or guaranteed quantities, nor shall they be considered maximum quantities. These quantities do net include
any eligible participant usage.

DELIVERY TIME:
The successful bidder will be required to accomplish delivery of any item ordered under the contract within seven (7)
working days from the placement of the order.

The use of a private carrier to make delivery does not relieve the successful bidder from the responsibility of
meeting the delivery requirement.

RETURNED GOODS:

The successful bidder must resolve all order and invoice discrepancies within ten business days from notification.
Products returned due to quality issues, duplicate shipments, over-shipments, etc. must be picked up by the
successful bidder within five business days of notification with no restocking or freight charges, and must be
replaced with specified products or the agency will be refunded/credited for the full purchase price.
Unauthorized substitutions for any products are not allowed.

Standard stock products ordered in error by the State of New Hampshire must be returned for full credit within
fifteen days of receipt. Products must be in re-saleable condition (original container, unused) and there will be no
restocking fee charged for these products. The using agency will be responsible for any freight charges to return
these items to the successful bidder.




INVOICING:

Invoicing shall be done to the Agency Remit Account on the basis of each order completed. Invoices shall clearly
indicate the quantity, description, packaging, date delivered, and contract price. Invoicing for eligible participants
will be in accordance with their individual requirements.

WARRANTY REQUIREMENTS:

Successful bidder shall be required to warranty all of the equipment awarded to bidder for a pericd of not less
than the manufacturer’s standard period of time, from the date the items are received, inspected and accepted
by the State of New Hampshire. The warranty shall cover 100% of all parts, shipping, labor, travel, lodging and
expenses.

CONTRACT AWARD:

The award shall be made to the responsible Vendor(s) meeting the criteria established in this RFB and providing
the lowest cost in total. The State reserves the right to reject any or all bids or any part thereof. If an award is
made it shall be, in the form of a State of New Hampshire Contract (s).

Successful Vendor will not be allowed to require any other type of order, nor will the successful Vendor be allowed to
require the filling out or signing of any other document by State of New Hampshire personnel.

SPECIFICATION COMPLIANCE:
Bidder's offer must meet or exceed the required specifications as written. The State of New Hampshire shall be the
sole determining factor of what meets or exceeds the required specifications.

Unless otherwise specified by the Bureau of Purchase and Property in this bid invitation document, all equipment
offered by the bidder must be new; shall not be used, rebuilt, refurbished; shall not have been used as
demonstration equipment, and shall not have been placed anywhere for evaluation purposes.

OFFER:

Bidder hereby offers to furnish grates and frames to State of New Hampshire agencies and institutions and to any
political sub-division and authorized non-profit organization wishing to participate, in accordance with all of the
requirements of this bid invitation at the following prices for the entire contract term and any extension.

MINIMUM ORDER:
There will be no minimum order whether in item quantity or dollar value associated with any contract resulting from
this bid.

VENDOR'S BALANCE OF PRODUCT LINE ITEMS

The items included in this bid are the items most commonly purchased by State of New Hampshire agencies, and
will be used for award purposes. However, during the term of confract, the state may wish to purchase other
Grates and Frames or related items from the successful Vendor's Balance of Product Line. Any Balance of
Product Line items shall be priced using the same discount or mark-up structure as the items being bid and shall
be governed by all the same terms and conditions as the items in this bid.

VENDOR CONTACT INFORMATION:
The following information is for this office to be able to contact a person knowledgeable of your bid response,
and who can answer questions regarding it: 920 729 —AA 4

Thowmas Calkins 430-FaS-Fore D00 - 55 - SDAS
Contact Person Local Telephone Number Toll Free Telephone Number
NEErAW , FP.\C_‘\M% (=2 ,
= = NEs NAWE AN F pe VRES.COUA WL . Mk Co. coun
Fax Number E-mail Address Company Website

Mm&uﬂc%mga% 14- 4\ -BA KD
Vendor Company Name DUNS #

Note: To be considered, bid must be signed and notarized on front cover sheet in the space provided.




SPECIFICATIONS

SPECIFICATIONS:

MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS & NEW HAMPSHIRE STANDARDS FOR GRATES AND FRAMES:

All castings furnished must be of minimum class 30 - 30,000 Ib. iron.

All grates, frames, manhole covers, etc are to be manufactured in the United States of America.

All dimensions will be as shown on New Hampshire standard sheets DR-1 DR-2 AND SL-1 with a tolerance of plus or
minus one (1) percent. Copies of these sheets are attached.

AASHTO M 105 will govern quality of finish and workmanship unless otherwise specified. Prefabricated metal
adjustment rings for catch basins, drop inlets and manholes shall conform to AASHTO M 105 also.

Each heat must be certified to be minimum class 30 iron by a domestic laboratory acceptable to the Department of
Transportation, Chief Materials and Research Engineer.

Steel grates shall be of structural steel conforming to AASHTO M 183M/M 183(ASTM A 36/A 36M). All grates shall be
fabricated as shown on plans or as approved. All top edges shall be flush, and all rivets must be tight and properly
headed. After fabrication, the grates shall be galvanized in accordance with AASHTO M 111 or ASTM A 153 as
applicable.

Each casting shipment must be accompanied by a statement on the contractor's stationery guaranteeing that
proper cerfification of the casting material has taken place,

The State reserves the right to test castings at random.

The State reserves the right to inspect laboratory certifications at its discretion.

Test costs will be borne by the State if castings tested meet the specifications of this proposal,

Should any castings fail, the costs of the test will be borne by the bidder.

All castings from the heat of a casting that fail to meet the minimum class 30 strength requirements will immediately
be returned to the vendor without penalty. Castings already in the ground accepted.

The State reserves the right to demand immediate replacement of any component purchased from this contract
that do not meet specifications

If the ASTM or AASHTO standard should change or be superseded, the most recent ASTM or AASHTO standard shall

apply
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OPT\OND BA\S LWO

Letteced ‘Siernl” T’ TR ok Y Power

MATERIAL: CAST GRAY IRON ASTM A—48, CLASS 35B, CONFORMS TO AASHTO M105.

FINISH: ND PAINT UNLESS SPECIFIED ON PURCHASE ORDER

WEIGHT: 324

g
=
a
&
<
=
g
E
=

TYPE "C" LD DESIGN

(1) OPEN PICKHOLE

’—————12 3/4" X 12 3/4'4| t

1L

7/8"

f

WAS NF-T2277

NF-18020002 |B

13
155
(14
e
54 i
= = r~
Sz %g
OE 'é
Ll_ig_
:';i Eﬁsgg
=
: _chm
a!" Z
pS
13
-
=z c.ﬁ
o -
RHEIEE
3 bl §
o2
- I
TEHHE

CAD DWG. REF: 1802000Z.DWG—




sras 008 Nk W02 IPUNOJUDUSBU MMM 1 —OM0'1000Z08L 1434 "OMQ QYD
g| 10002081 -4N eeiP-9e-008 IO ¥10Z/12/€0 avo
AdONNO4 HVYN33IN Lds  av
9NIN3dO L X L ¥04 1=/t oN W
JAVYL V-Z08l-Y auu| Twes N13/9Y0  wa B/L gL
9LZZL—4N SYM #ay  :LHOIIM ———.8/s £l

Y30HO 3ISVYHOMNA NO Q314103dS SSIINN LNIYd ON  :HSINI

‘GOLA OLHSYY OL SWHOJNGD '8SE SSY10 'Sh—¥ WISV NOMI AVHO LSYD “IVRALYN -8/L e
W _

2/

—

! N N .
_| nﬂﬂﬂﬂm .W// /4|%| _

m 7 _ £1 _ N

= I A ! )
\le- “WHHHHHHHMNHHHHHHHJQ
I Il
I I
Il I
P Y] I I
¢ 4 > I I
> ,mm ’ I II
* I Il
z ! I I
o L 3 I i
S = I I
* I I
I Il
I II
"_ |
— \ m - F ESREE L

AWEIY S1 T Ne\uwdo




STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE
ELECTRONIC ALTERNATE W-9 FORM

Please use this form to provide the requested information

Business Name: Neenah Foundry Company
Additional or DBA Name:
Legal Name: Neenah Foundry Company

Remit Address:; 2121 Brooks Avenue
Remit City: Neenah Remit State: WI  Remit Zip: 54956

Business Address: 2121 Brooks Avenue
Business City: Neenah Business State: WI  Business Zip: 54956
Phone: (920) 725-7000

Taxpayer Identification Number: 39-1580331,
Principal Activity(s): Product/Merchandise
Designation(s): S Corporation

Diversity Type(s):

Under penalty of perjury, | declare that the information provided is true, correct & complete, to the
best of my knowledge and belief.
Signature: Thomas Calkins, ELECTRONICALLY SIGNED

Pursuant to IRS Regulations, you must furnish your Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN) to the
State whether or not you are required to file tax returns. If this number is not provided, you may be
subject to a 28% withholding on each payment made to you. To avoid this 28% withholding & to
ensure that accurate tax information is reported to the IRS, A RESPONSE |S REQUIRED.




